

BID # 5884

HERBICIDES AND CHEMICALS

WRO 23 MAY 2024

		BW I	CHEMPRO	HELENA	HERITAGE	RED RIVER SPECIALTIES	SITK AWK	SIMPLOT	FIS OUTDOOR	
HERBICIDE LIQUID RANGER PRO ON EQUAL	2.5 CONTAINER	32.50 *	38.75	41.25	37.36	37.50	51.66	45.40	41.81	
	CASE	65.00 *	77.50	82.50	74.72	74.60	103.32	90.80	83.62	
	30 GAL DRUM	408.00 *	465.00	480.00	430.43	447.60	594.50	511.76	475.00	
		NUFARM AMMICALS DSRP10078 225	NUFARM CAEOIT 41 FYTAA	BAYER RANGER DIO	BAYER RANGER PRO 86758415	RANGER PRO/BAYER 524-517	RANGER PRO MONSANTO 86758415	BAYER CROPS SCIENCE LP FIA # 524-517	BAYER RANGER PRO	
LESCO TRACKER SPRAY DYE BLUE	2.5 CONTAINER	60.00	62.25	90.00	49.98	43.70 *	54.10	95.45	55.40	
	CASE	120.00	124.50	180.00	98.76	87.40 *	108.20	190.90	110.80	
	30 GAL DRUM	\$5,245 250 GAL TOTE	747.00	900.00	NO BID	NO BID	597.92 *	1050.00	1095.90	
		SANCO END SC140	NOVITA BLUE MARKING DYE	MILLIKES BLAZON 700	HERITAGE-MYSTIC SPI BLUE HP#1409198	RRSI IVM MARKING DYE RRSI 14070	LESCO 008820	SIMPLOT PARTNER RICHY-ON-BLUE	HERITAGE PFG 2.5 GAL MYSTIC SPI BLUE 30 GAL MYSTIC HC	
PENDULUM PRE-EMERGENT LIQUID	2.5 CONTAINER	86.85 *	122.50	131.10	88.32	91.05	156.79	112.50	113.70	
	CASE	173.70 *	245.00	264.20	176.64	182.10	313.58	225.00	227.40	
	30 GAL DRUM	NO BID	NO BID	1585.20 *	NO BID	NO BID	1821.48	N/A	1035.00 * *156AL	
		DREXEL CHEMICAL DX10010102	DREXEL PIN-DEE 3.3 EC	BASF LENDULU 275	DREXEL PIN-DEE 3.3 RC KRTANDEE 0258	PIN DEE 3.3 NUFARM 19713-668	BASF 59049276	BASF CORP 241-416	BASF PENDULUM AQUACAP DREXEL 1.25 GALT CS OF 4 \$201.88	50.47
KAMMO NON-IONIC AGENT	2.5 CONTAINER	24.50 *	64.00	83.75	27.85	61.00	77.10 (3x16G)	125.00	82.00	
	CASE	49.00 *	128.00	167.50	55.70	122.00	102.80	250.00	164.00	
	30 GAL DRUM	NO BID	768.00	1005.00	380.98	NO BID	4x16AL 771.00	N/A	366.00 *	
		DREXEL PX 8020A	BAYER INTERNATIONAL CIDR-KICK	HELENA KAMMO 001	HERITAGE WINDSURF PRO HP#170778	CIDE KICK 07035	LESCO 400511	SIMPLOT PARTNER SPRAY-SLICK	HERITAGE PFG WINDSURF PRO	